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100% Pinot Noir 

Crafted from 100% Pinot Noir grapes sourced from Napa’s
Carneros region. The climate in Carneros creates optimal
growing conditions for Pinot and thus produces incredible
rosés. The 2022 vintage is well balanced with bright acidity
allowing the flavors of the region to shine through.

100% stainless steel tanks for 6 months

A delicate coral pink in the glass, this wine opens with
alluring aromas of orange blossom, rose petal, and guava.
White peach and citrus flavors abound on the palate,
leading to a core of wild strawberry. There’s a beautiful
depth and elegance to this wine, accompanied by
freshness and energy. It finishes with bright acidity that
lingers on the palate.

The Leslie Rosé is sourced exclusively from parcels of the
best vineyards in Napa’s acclaimed Carneros region,
including the winery’s own Lewis Vineyard located along
the shores of the San Pablo Bay. The cooling influences of
the bay as well as the nearby Pacific Ocean allow for
delicate maturation of the grapes and retention of bright
flavors. This wine was crafted with Pinot Noir grapes that
were grown specifically to showcase the attributes we
desire most in rosé – fresh aromatics, vibrant flavors, and
natural acidity.

Enjoy Responsibly.  © 2022 Frank Family Vineyards, Calistoga, CA
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2022  Les l i e  Rosé

BOTTLED:

HARVEST DATE:

VARIETAL COMPOSITION:

13%

ACID:  

September 22, 2022

March 2023

pH: 

3.31

0.69 g/100mL

ALCOHOL: 

92 POINTS
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